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OTTEN JOHNSON ELECTS MELINDA M. BECK AND SETH A. COHEN 

AS DIRECTORS AND SHAREHOLDERS OF THE FIRM 

Denver, Colorado – Otten Johnson Robinson Neff + Ragonetti PC (Otten Johnson) is pleased to announce that 
Melinda Beck and Seth Cohen have been elected shareholders and directors of the firm. Both Seth and Melinda 
have already distinguished themselves both within the firm as well as in the community. Their new roles were 
effective January 1, 2020. 
 
Seth Cohen joined the firm in 2018. He received his J.D. from the University of Michigan Law School (1999) magna 
cum laude, and was named Order of the Coif. Seth is a business attorney, veteran private equity executive and 
former small business owner with significant transactional, capital markets and mergers & acquisitions experience. 
He leverages his diverse and multi-dimensional background to provide practical, results-oriented counsel to his 
clients in the corporate, private equity and real estate sectors. As a member of the firm’s Real Estate and Business 
Transactions & Capital Markets Practice Groups, Seth will continue to represent real estate investment and 
developer clients, private equity funds and business owners. Seth is currently serving on the firm’s Marketing & BD 
Committee. 
 
Melinda Beck joined the firm in 2019. She earned her J.D. from the University of Denver College of Law (1994). 
She is a real estate and land use attorney with over twenty years of experience in private practice and additional 
time spent as a government attorney. Her practice focuses on commercial and residential development, land 
use, real estate purchase and sale transactions, easements, office, warehouse and retail leasing, conservation 
easement transactions, and oil and gas transactions related to real estate. Melinda's conservation law expertise 
includes the donation and purchase and sale of conservation easements to land trusts and local governments by 
private landowners throughout Colorado and nationally. Melinda is part of the firm’s Real Estate and Land Use 
Practice Groups.  
 
“We are extremely fortunate to have seasoned professionals like Melinda and Seth join our team,” commented Jim 
Johnson, Otten Johnson’s managing director. “I know they will continue to make a positive impact both within the 
firm and in the greater Colorado legal community.” 
 
Otten Johnson is a leading commercial law firm in Colorado, highly regarded for its real estate and land use 
practices. Our attorneys work with clients in a wide array of industries, with a particular emphasis on finding real 
world, business-minded solutions. In the real estate industry, Otten Johnson's clients include owners, developers, 
builders, investors, banks and financial institutions, commercial tenants, managers and brokers, whether in the 
multi-family, residential subdivision, office, retail, hotel and resort, mixed-use, or industrial sectors. The firm provides 
legal services related to real estate and business transactions, financing, land use and entitlement matters, urban 
renewal and other public/private partnerships, mergers and acquisitions, tax, eminent domain, regulatory 
compliance, workouts, restructuring, bankruptcy, and commercial litigation. For more information about Otten 
Johnson Robinson Neff + Ragonetti PC, please contact Heather Baker at hbaker@ottenjohnson.com or visit our 
website: www.ottenjohnson.com.  

 
### 


